Christine L. Krzysiak, Treasurer

Former Owner Control #
Blooming Valley Boro

John J. McElroy 14-0-003565
Vernon Twp

Donald E. (dec) & Elizabeth L. 65-0-052808
North h/w

0il Creek Twp

Erie House Buyers LLC 38-0-024095
Randolph Twp

Lawrence (dec) & Debra Crannell ~ 40-0-026433
Sadsbury Twp

Wehr, Wilbert L. & Lucille L. h/w  44-0-029934
both deceased

West Shenango Twp 48-0-039687
Charles Burns

Sparta Twp

John C. & Jemima J. Byler h/w 49-0-040116
Spring Twp

Renee D. Kehn REMOVED PRIOR TO SALE
Arvilla M Bayletts 51-0-102128
Springboro Borough

Wanette M. Humphreys 52-0-041717
Ted & Beth Humphreys h/w

Summit Twp

Dale A Pincourt 55-0-043831

OFFICE OF THE

Treasurer of Crawford County

903 Diamond Park

Meadville, Pennsylvania 16335
Phone 814/333-7332

Fax 814/333-2025

Judicial Sale 2016A: 10/14/2016

Description

Lot

Lot & Bldg

1.608 Acres & Bldg

Lot & Bldg

Lot & Bldg

Trailer on Lot 2

3 Acres & Bldg

Trailer lot 6

Lot & bldg

Lot

Results
Sold To:

Glenn G. & Margaret Armstrong
27184 E Oli Creek Rd Guys Mills PA 16327

Matthew D. Highman Boot Box Realty LLC
11894 Pennsylvania Ave Meadville PA 16335

Marty Rutter
23000 Capp Rd Venango PA 16440

Derek Metzler Country Boy Property
18984 Wheelock Hill Rd Cambridge Spgs PA 16403

Paul F. Hoyson
10911 Lake Forest St Conneaut Lake PA 16316

Now in Repository

Now in Repository

Now in Repository

Marty Rutter
23000 Capp Rd Veneango PA 16440

Now in Repository

Kelsey G. Beatty, Deputy Treasurer

Amount

$500.00

$1,100.00

$1,000.00

$17,000.00

$14,000.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2,100.00

No Bid



Michael J. & Martina Vitabo h/w
Bruce F. Ricey & Judy A. Kelsey
Joe Belfiore

Property One, Inc

Michael & Cindy Bump

Titusville Ward 2
Leo G. & Ronda G. Kerr h/w

Vernon Twp
Kimberly & Jason Hannold

Venango Twp
Planned Futures Corp

Vernon Twp
Ronald Knapik Jr & Michael D
Ratchford

Aaron R. Yost

Tina Boumans

Aaron L. & Kelly A. Delp h/w

George A . (dec) & Melvina M.
Jackson
George A . (dec) & Melvina M.
Jackson

Michael Staudt

Wayne Twp
Planned Futures Corp

Woodcock Twp
Elizabeth M. Curtis(dec) &
Paul Edgar Curtis

55-0-044283

55-0-058203

55-0-102257

55-0-044641

55-0-107358

57-0-045833

65-0-050275

63-0-049716

65-0-050819

65-0-051194

65-0-052402

65-0-052717

65-0-053000

65-0-053001

65-0-056859

66-0-053346

67-0-055230

Lot

Trailer Lot 7
Trailer Lot 70
Trailer Lot 48

Trailer Lot 33

Lot

Trailer Lot 14

Lot

Lots

Trailer Lot 34

1/2 Acre & Lot

Lot & Bidg

Lot

Lot

Trailer Lot 5

lot6 &7

Lot & Bldg

Now in Repository
Now in Repository
Now in Repository
Now in Repository

Crosby Calvin
12770 Birch St Conneaut Lake PA 16316

Now in Repository
Ann Knott
P.O. Box 55 21689 River St Venango PA 16440

Marty Rutter
23000 Capp Rd Venango PA 16440

Now in Repository
John J. Badagliacca
14617 Gasteiger Rd Exit Meadville PA 16335
Now in Repository

Marty Rutter
23000 Capp Rd Venango PA 16440

Now in Repository
Now in Repository
John J. Badagliacca
14617 Gasteiger Rd Exit Meadville PA 16335

William H. Rapp
32 Longsdale Pittsburgh PA 15212

Equity Trust Co. Custodian fbo Raymond Andel, IRA

P.O. Box 305 Meadville PA 16335

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$500.00

No Bid

$500.00

$500.00

No Bid

$500.00

No Bid

$500.00

No Bid

No Bid

$700.00

$500.00

$2,000.00



