Crawford County Tax Claim
903 Diamond Park
Meadville, Pa. 16335
(814) 333-7332

Christine L. Krzysiak, Director Kelsey Beatty, Assistant Director

JUDICIAL SALE 2015 A: 7/17/2015

Results

Former Owner Control # Description Bid Amount Sold to:

Beaver Township

Philip A. Carnes, Jr & Philip 12-0-000610 1.24 ACRES $ 650.00 Emanuel Schwartz

Gordon Davis 12-0-000823 Lot $500.00 Emanuel Schwartz

Bloomfield Township

Shirley Post 13-0-002842 Trailer No Bid

Cambridge Township

Robert Humes, Sr & 15-0-003731 Y% Acre & Bldg $500.00 Michael Johnson

Francis E. Humes

Conneaut Township

Chauncey R. Penfield  19-0-058495 1.5351 Acres & Bldg $3,450.00  Matthew Lee Chavez



Conneautville Borough

Walnut Investing, LLC 20-0-007623 Lot & Bldg

Cussewago Township

Carla Vega 22-0-103689 Trailer

Jeff A. Huya & 22-0-008895 Trailer

Tracy L. Huya

East Fallowfield Township

Robert Tribley, Il &  25-0-056317 Trailer

Regina Tribley

Greenwood Township

Scott Troxell 27-0-011774 Lot $700.00
Dawn White & 27-0-056827 Trailer
Kevin White

Hayfield Township

Gerald Swackhamer 28-0-057117 Trailer

Hydetown Borough

John A. Fay & Vonda E. Fay 29-0-014184 Lot & Bldg $1,500.00

East Mead Township

Arthur P. Lane & Briar Lane 31-0-101357 Trailer

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Ryan Hays

No Bid

No Bid

Kevin Whitman

No Bid



West Mead Township

Kenneth M. & 32-0-015781 Lot & Bldg $2,000.00 Patrick E. Donahue
Roberta A. Onspaugh

Pamela S. Duarte 32-0-015828 Lot & Bldg $10,100.00 ZRR, LLC
Daniel J. Leveto & 32-0-016480 Lot 6 No Bid
Margret A. Leveto

Daniel M. Authier & 32-0-016894 Lot5 & Bldg $6,700.00 Stephen Lyon

Linda M. Authier

Meadville Ward 5

Gary E. & Jean M. Bosco 37-0-023495 Lot & Bldg
Gary E. & Jean M. Bosco 37-0-023497 Lot
Gary E. & Jean M. Bosco 37-0-023498 Lot

North Shenango Township

James L. Juracko 46-0-033544 Lot & Bldg
Spring Township
Laura E. Cramer 51-0-041095 Trailer

Summit Township

James L. Zoner 55-0-043533 1 Acre & Bldg

Venango Borough

Jason & Allison Petrucelli  64-0-049749 Lot & Bldg

$13,500.00

$10,500.00

$20,000.00 Travel Services Inc.

No Bid

No Bid

$20,000.00 Samuel P. Juracko

No Bid

David D. Baker 111

Marty R Rutter



