
Crawford County Tax Claim 

903 Diamond Park 

Meadville, Pa. 16335 

(814) 333-7332 
Christine L. Krzysiak, Director                                                                         Kelsey Beatty, Assistant Director 

 

JUDICIAL SALE 2015 B:  12/11/2015 

Results 

 

Former Owner  Control #         Description     Bid Amount Sold to: 

Wayne Township 

 

Ralph E. Shelley 66-0-053179   Lot & Trailer          $6000.00          Pratt Properties  

 

West Mead Township 

Rosane F Garczek  32-0-017891                Lot 8 & Bldg     $3900.00           Marty Rutter 

Luther R Buress                32-0-018011    Lot           $500.00             Kevin Sterling 

Gordon Davis    32-0-018438          2.04 Acres                   $900.00       Mike & Andrea Potosky 

Edmund H Stickle Jr     32-0-018076  Lots                No Bid   

& Anna Whitt Stickle 

   Meadville Ward I 

Jason Vogel         33-0-019141            Lot & Bldg           $ 11,500.00             ZRR, LLC 

Meadville Ward II 

Catherine M Snyder&    34-0-020161       Lot & Bldg  $600.00  Lawrence Zehr 

R Christopher Snyder  

Fletcher & Tracy Chatman 34-0-020120        Lot & Bldg $1800.00 Mike & Andrea Potosky 

Paul F & Jacquelin Ann  34-0-020126         Lot & Bldg $2000.00  Zrr, LLC 

 Cassidy 

Ronald E Kessler 34-0-020877        Lot & Bldg $10,100.00 Approved Auto LLC   

 

 



 

 

Meadville Ward III 

Donald M & Dedra Prester    35-0-022421   Lot & Bldg              $ 1900.00      Red Star Group 

 

Meadville Ward IV 

Laurie Johnson Peebles  35-0-022418        Lot & Bldg                   $1000.00 ZRR,LLC 

Burnett EtAl      

Meadville Ward V 

Paul M & Cherise Miller         37-0-023519     Lot & Bldg                                              No Bid 

Jeffery S. Peters  37-0-070195 Trailer Only                                           No Bid 

 

Oil Creek Township 

Brian E Antill                          38-0-024899         Lot & Bldg       $1400.00             Kevin Sterling              

Ron & Robin Thompson           38-0-057989          Trailer                                                      No Bid   

Ray E. &Theresa E. Lind 38-0-024971         Lot & Bldg                      $1600.00           Bruce & Rosella Dibble 

 

Pine Township 

Frank W. Pogel Jr &               39-0-025642           Tri Lot                        $1000.00        Fizel Enterprises  

Elaine M Pogel 

Randolph Township 

Guy Fultz                                  40-0-025901               Trailer                No Bid 

 

Rockdale Township 

Forest W. & Rhonda G           42-0-028036             Lot & Bldgs                  $6750.00           Pratt Properties 

 Kimmy                      

Forest W. & Rhonda G           42-0-057927             Lot                                 $1400.00           Pratt Properties 

 Kimmy                      

Sadsbury Township 

Steven J. & Jeri L Griffith      44-0-030249           Lot & Bldg                 $3900.00     Ryan Hays & Jeffrey K Hans 


