Christine L. Krzysiak, Treasurer

OFFICE OF THE
Treasurer of Crawford County
903 Diamond Park

Meadville, Pennsylvania 16335
Phone 814/333-7332 Fax 814/333-2025

Judicial Sale 2015D: 6/3/2016

Kelsey G. Beatty, Deputy Treasurer

Results

Former Owner Control # Description Sold To: Amount

Athens Township

Alan & Rebecca Wise 11-0-000275 Lot & Bldg Edward John Holcomb $45,000.00
33049 ST HWY 77 Centerville PA 16404

Cambridge Township

Joanne Holden aka Joann Holden 15-0-004374 7.6 Acres & Bldg Donald R. & Jodi L. Caldwell $35,000.00

aka Doris J. Holden 22496 Gravel Run Rd Segertown PA 16433

Conneaut Township

Larry E. & Cheryl A. Newberry 19-0-006664 1.608 Acres & Bldg CC Real Estate Holdings LLC $1,500.00
3850 Carpenter Rd. Linesville PA 16424

Hayfield Township

Gary A. & Teresa A. Miller 28-0-057478  Trailer Lot D-20 Steve H. Lyon $500.00
10821 Kennedy Hill Rd. Meadville PA 16335

City of Meadville

Raymond Ebbert aka Raymond J. Ebbert  35-0-022772 Lot & Bldg Marty R. Rutter $2,400.00

aka Raymond John Ebbert 23000 Capp Rd Venango PA 16440

and Kris Ebbert aka Kris

Jeffrey L. & Patricia A. Stivanson 35-0-022642 Lot & Bldg ZRR, LLC $1,700.00
1100 Morgan Village Rd. Meadville PA 13665

Randolph Township

Richard G. & Merle F. Schwab 40-0-026151 Lot Mervin Wengerd $1,100.00
26816 Guys Mills Rd Meadville PA 16335

Richard G. & Merle F. Schwab 40-0-026153 Lot 9 & Bldg Kathryn J. Young & Philip M. Young Sr $2,100.00
26821 ST HWY 27 Guys Mills PA 16327

Rockdale Township ,

William & Shirley Mae Gillespie 42-0-027675 1.99 Acres & Trailer Gary & Maryann Hull $5,000.00
25801 Pinewoods Rd Waterford PA 16441

James & Jeanette Averill 42-0-027729 51/2 Acres & Bldg No Bid 0

& Trailer Now in Repository
N Shenango Township
James R. Schmeltz 46-0-032911 Lots 470-471 Pratt Properties LLC $7,100.00
& Bldg 16540 Pratt Rd. Saegertown PA 16433

Franklin T. Peffers 46-0-034075 Lot & Bldg William C. Wentworth $4,700.00
224 W 3rd ST x5095 Eagle CO 81631

Franklin T. Peffers 46-0-034076 Lot & Bldg Raymond F. Garfold Jr. /Raymond F. Garfold $13,000.00

3087 Piney Bluff Dr South Park PA 15129



S Shenango Township

Candice Whitesal

Candice Whitesal

George T. & Carla Haynes

Jean B Rechberger &
Edward H. Rechberger Jr.

W. Shenango Township

Edna Thompson & William E. &
Margaret A. Thompson

Russell K. Floch

City of Titusville

Edwin & Queen E. Tucker

Blanche E. Kunz

Townville Borough

Dennis P. & Antonette M. Smith

Dennis P. & Antonette M. Smith

Venango Borough

John W. Woodward

John W. & Barbara J Woodward

47-0-036705

47-0-036706

47-0-037698

47-0-038186

48-0-039347

48-0-039446

56-0-045016

56-0-045681

60-0-047810

60-0-047739

64-0-049753

64-0-049756

Lots 756 757

Lots 758 759

1.646 Acres

Lots 33 & 32

2 Acres & Bldg

Lot 167

Lot & Bldg

Lot & Bldg

3/4 Acres & Bldg

Lot

Lot

Lot

No Bid
Now in Repository

No Bid
Now in Repository

Justin White
207 Arrowhead Dr Slippery Rock PA 16057

No Bid
Now in Repository

Potosky, Mike J. & Andrea M
13003 Wolf Rd Guys Mills PA 16327

No Bid
Now in Repository

James Elliot
306 N Franklin St Titusville PA 16354

Shannon L. Borkovec
19669 Coon Rd Spartansburg PA 16434

Mike & Andrea Potosky
13003 Wolf Rd Guys Mills, PA 16327

Charles C. Frantz & Brittany J. Frantz
16704 Drake Hill Rd Townville PA 16360

Kevin W. Sr. & Teresa E. Forcier
21632 South St PO Box 131 VenangoPA 16440

Red Star Group LLC
101 Monroe St Edinboro PA 16412

$1,600.00

$6,600.00

$2,900.00

$2,900.00

$6,000.00

$500.00

$3,000.00

$800.00



