PUBLIC AUCTION

BY CRAWFORD COUNTY TAX CLAIM BUREAU
2015 UPSET TAX SALE RESULTS

FOR 2013 TAXES

SALE DATE: SEPTEMBER 25, 2015
10:00 A.M. in the Crawford County Courthouse Assembly Room

LAST UPDATED: September 25, 2015

Novak, Harrison Rudolph

Rankin, David L.

Bellinger, Robert Edward

Carlson, Bradley P.

Legnoski, Cody

Brown, Frederick L.

Mcelroy, John J.

Jones, David H & Henrietta

Kern, William & Moorhead, Denise &
Clark, Norman & Belinda

ATHENS TOWNSHIP

11-0-000068 2 % Acres
SOLD: Keith Klingler

11-0-108318 Trailer Only

BEAVER TOWNSHIP

12-0-070005 Trailer
12-0-000731 Trailers
12-0-108151 Trailer

BLOOMING VALLEY

14-0-003445 3.3 Acres
SOLD: Keith Klingler

14-0-003565 Lot & Bldg

CAMBRIDGE TOWNSHIP

15-0-004053 Lot 8

15-0-003889 Lot

537021
$475.00

$2437.85
NO BID

$4079.87
NO BID

$1794.51
NO BID

$2201.01
NO BID

$631.46
$631.46

$4895.99
NO BID

$490.82
NO BID

$387.19

SOLD: Stephen Drusko $387.19



COCHRANTON BORO

Rostron, George M. 18-0-005830 Lot & Bldg $7525.64
SOLD: John McGarvey $7525.64

CONNEAUT TOWNSHIP

Cody, Milton Gene 19-0-007061 Trailer Lot 9b $574.68
NO BID

Manley, Michael & Garry Wayne 19-0-006719 Lot 77 $409.45
NO BID

McLucas, Norma 19-0-108336 Trailer $520.91
NO BID

CUSSEWAGO TOWNSHIP

North, Donald E. & Elizabeth L. 22-0-008363 11/3 Acres & Bldg $4940.97
NO BID

Sanner, Paul E. 22-0-008374 2.11 Acres & Bldg $9640.23
NO BID

E. FALLOWFIELD TOWNSHIP

Stockman, Kaleena 25-0-109149 Trailer Lot 15 $995.37
NO BID

Yallum, Patricia 25-0-011037 3 Acres, Bldg & Trailer $11281.97
NO BID

GREENWOOD TOWNSHIP

Bartorillo, James 27-0-109252 Trailer Only $592.00
NO BID
Bubna, Dennis 27-0-011811 8.58 Acres, Bldg & Trailer $6406.61
SOLD: ZRR, LLC $6406.61

HAYFIELD TOWNSHIP

Albaugh, Frank & Altenborough, Ranae 28-0-013881 Trailer Lot 19 $2681.85
NO BID
Jones, Duane Douglas & Laura Ann 28-0-012972 1.20 Acre & Bldg $4853.53

SOLD: Jared Bollinger $4853.53



Madden, John A.

Pachuk, David E.

Gideon, Monty

Mervine, Jeffrey A.

Norr, Julie D.

Corliss, Robert J. & Sarah S.

Duncan, James

Duncan, James

Henry, Larry R. & Cheryl A.

Kessler, Richard M. &

Vogan, Ronald F. & Jeni B. V.

McDonald, James H. & Glenn A.

Reservoir Investments, LLC.

Scheffler, Gladyce B. Et Al

HYDETOWN BORO

29-0-014201

LINESVILLE BORO

30-0-014810

EAST MEAD TOWNSHIP

31-0-057991

31-0-101378

31-0-105285

Lot & Bldg

Lot & Bldg

Trailer Lot 13

Trailer Lot 51

Trailer Lot 10

WEST MEAD TOWNSHIP

32-0-017173

32-0-017067

32-0-017607

32-0-015963

32-0-017154

32-0-018130

32-0-018043

32-0-017147

Lot & Bldg

Lot

% Acre & Bldg

Lot 34 & Bldg

Lot 64

6.28 Acres

SOLD: Keith Klingler

Lots

Lot 55

SOLD: Phil Allan

$2869.44
NO BID

$123,170.37
NO BID

$379.39
NO BID

$2369.10
NO BID

$531.58
NO BID

$6866.89
NO BID

$660.72
NO BID

$14645.87
NO BID

$6554.64
NO BID

$491.97
NO BID

$295.01
$295.01

$6942.20
NO BID

$506.13
$506.13



McCracken, Kathleen L.

Porter, Louis L. & Ella M.

Boyle, Linda K.

Pazdyk, Genevieve M.

Sellers, Robert ; Charlotte; & William

Dubose, Christopher C.

Dubose, Christopher C.

McFadden, Dawn M.

Winters, Randy

Kuntz, James A. & Kimberly A.

Repasky, Frank J.

Spear, Jon R. & Cindy L.

MEADVILLE WARD 1

33-0-019019 Lot & Bldg

33-0-019398 Lot & Bldg
MEADVILLE WARD 2

34-0-021349 Lot & Bldg

34-0-020439 Lot 3 & Bldg

SOLD: ZRR, LLC

34-0-020277 Lot & Bldg
MEADVILLE WARD 4

36-0-023335 Lot

36-0-023348 Lot & Bldg

MEADVILLE WARD 5

37-0-023721 Trailer Lot 21

37-0-070196 Trailer Lot 214

OIL CREEK TOWNSHIP

38-0-024131 1 Acre

SOLD: Stephen Drusko

38-0-024645 1 Acre & Bldg

38-0-024859 Lot & Bldg

$8678.83
NO BID

$6587.01
NO BID

$12,426.68
NO BID

$7423.07
$9500.00

$7465.32
NO BID

$3433.24
NO BID

$10,801.87
NO BID

$2650.12
NO BID

$836.25
NO BID

$327.43
$475.00

$742.69
NO BID

$3081.67
NO BID



Ferraro, Samuel T.

Gillespie, Robert Frank Et Al

Holfelder, Nina

Frost, Arthur Elton

Troyer, Melvin M. & Rose J.

ROCKDALE TOWNSHIP

42-0-027845 1.49 Acres & Bldg
42-0-027673 1 Acre & Trailer
SOLD: Gary/Maryann Hull
42-0-108284 Trailer
ROME TOWNSHIP

43-0-056696 1% Acres

SOLD: William Lutz
43-0-057042 16.01 Acres & Bldg

SADSBURY TOWNSHIP

Cotter, William 44-0-101899 Lot 525

Cotter, William Hanlon & Dorothy 44-0-031478 Lots

Drusko, Cristina J. 44-0-029452 Lots 51,52 & 53
Drusko, Cristina J. 44-0-032180 Lots 77-78-79
Miller, John 44-0-057333 Trailer lot 14

Ours, Elsie M. 44-0-029357 .856 Acres & Trailer
Owens, Amy 44-0-031541 Trailer Lot 3
Robinson, Sandra 44-0-029879 Lots

Urquhart, Marvin A; Harris, William E.& 44-0-032085 Lots

Brannen, Tony Alan Jr.

$3397.84
NO BID

$755,51
$755.51

$1037.39
NO BID

537241
$2100.00

$6059.07
NO BID

$557.98
NO BID

$1129.84
NO BID

$290.77
NO BID

$290.77
NO BID

$2788.75
NO BID

$1435.03
NO BID

$625.56
NO BID

$11,767.44
NO BID

$573.36
NO BID



Wilson, Michael & Linda

Eszlari, Elmer F. & Coliannia, Edith E.

Fricovsky, Helen S. & Karen

Hoffman, Robert R.

Johnson, James H.

Jones, Emerson D.

Long, Craig W. & Patrella, John

Poderzay, Veronica & Edward JR. &

Fredrick M.

Pozzuto, Lucy

Riscatti, Alessandra S.

Schomburger, T.A.

Vetter, Thomas H.

Vetter, Thomas H.

Vetter, Thomas H.

44-0-029367

1 Acres

SOLD: Richard Smith

N. SHENANGO TOWNSHIP

46-0-032899

46-0-033002

46-0-033333

46-0-032679

46-0-034373

46-0-032662

46-0-035402

46-0-033752

46-0-033049

46-0-034731

46-0-032860

46-0-032861

46-0-035058

SOLD:

Lot 448

Lot 655

Lot

Nancy/Jeff A. McGrath

Lot 39

Lot 78

Lot 9

Lots, Bldg & Trailer

SOLD: Nick Paroska

Trailer Lot 13

Lot 9a-10a

Lot 360

Lots 370, 579

Lot 371 & Bldg

Lot 225

$591.50
$1250.00

$337.35
NO BID

$934.60
NO Bid

$577.59
$577.59

$1134.51
NO BID

$646.07
NO BID

$600.30
NO BID

$5392.77
$9300.00

$301.51
NO BID

$347.63
NO BID

§775.13
NO BID

$721.60
NO BID

$2350.07
NO BID

$417.63
NO BID



S SHENANGO TOWNSHIP

Ball, Donald 47-0-101986 Lot 115 & Trailer

$1401.83

SOLD: Robert Eagleson $1401.83

Fanous, Mohsen H. 47-0-037044 Lots 189, 190

$824.27

SOLD: Barbara B. Miller $824.27

Labryer, Norvall E. 47-0-101950 Lots 201& 202& Bldg
Labryer, Norvall E. 47-0-101951 Lots 203 & 204
Mayernick, Ronald 47-0-037653 Trailer Lot 27

Michic, Ronald 47-0-036715 Lots 776,777

SOLD: Ron Barton

Wilson, Kenneth 47-0-038683 Lots 348-349
Wilson, Kenneth 47-0-038684 Lot 350
Wilson, Kenneth 47-0-038686 10 Lots

W SHENANGO TOWNSHIP

Floch, Russell Kline Estate 48-0-039080 Lot 280
Vankanegan, Clarence & Elizabeth Ann 48-0-039162 Lots
Vankanegan, Esther 48-0-039163 Lots

SPARTA TOWNSHIP

Rogers, Tammy 49-0-070316 Trailer

$1138.80
NO BID

$1138.80
NO BID

$1066.05
NO BID

$400.00
$400.00

$2562.00
NO BID

$1542.22
NO BID

$11123.97
NO BID

$447.98
NO BID

$503.66
NO BID

$467.82
NO BID

$938.86
NO BID



Terrill, Terry L.

Lassman, Carl

Spring Hill Estates

Johnston, Ray

Turner, Ben J. & Kristi A.

Turner, Ben J. & Kristi A.

Turner, Ben J. & Kristi A.

Vandervort, Mark S. & Kimberly A.

Edwards, Marvin & Joanna

Edwards, Marvin & Joanna

Park, Brienna

Bortzer, Raymond E. & Sandra L.

SPARTANSBURG

50-0-040478

SPRING TOWNSHIP

51-0-102130

51-0-102089

SPRINGBORO

52-0-041798

STEUBEN TOWNSHIP

53-0-042039

53-0-042040

53-0-042041

53-0-041984

SUMMIT TOWNSHIP

55-0-044202

55-0-044203

55-0-043787

TITUSVILLE WARD 1

56-0-045108

11/5 Acres & Bldg

Trailer Lot 7

Trailer Lot 15

Trailer Lot 4

Lot & Bldg
Lot
SOLD: lan Hamilton

Lot & Bldg
SOLD: lan Hamilton

1 Acres & Bldg
SOLD: John Hillburn

1 Acre & Bldg
7 Acres
SOLD: David Pitts

Trailer Lot 3

Lot & Bldg

$5471.17
NO BID

$1401.08
NO BID

$2291.16
NO BID

$501.12
NO BID

$2539.64
NO Bid

$330.32
$330.32

$1107.48
$1107.48

$3895.82
$6600.00

$4344.41
NO BID

5355.55
$850.00

$1159.47
NO BID

$4936.44
NO BID



Hazen, Susan K.

McQuown, Forrest C. & Ruth A.

Biltz, Arthur F Jr.

Bush, David A. & Paige R.

Hicks, Marilyn L.

Shetler, Samuel M. &
Stricklen, Dawna D.

Karns, Wallace H. Il

Petachi, Philip C.

Sopher, William & Terresa A.

Wolfram, Crystal

Wolfram, Nicholas J.

Demaison, David G.

56-0-045581

TITUSVILLE WARD 2

57-0-046607

TITUSVILLE WARD 4

59-0-047607

59-0-047553

59-0-047569

59-0-047319

TROY TOWNSHIP

61-0-048283

61-0-048322

61-0-048618

61-0-070369

61-0-102378

UNION TOWNSHIP

62-0-048899 4.165 Acres, Bldgs & 6 Trailers

Lot & Bldg

Lot & Bldg

11.45 Acres
SOLD: Keith Klingler

Lot & Bldg

Lot & Bldg

Lot & Bldg

1 Acre
SOLD: Keith Klingler

Lot 33
SOLD: Keith Klingler
Lot & Trailer

Trailer Lot 11

Trailer Lot 15

$2755.39
NO BID

$6568.57
NO BID

$519.08
$15200.00

$3689.18
NO BID

$4121.93
NO BID

$1574.07
NO BID

S270.51
$1100.00

$509.50
$509.50

$4107.77
NO BID

$808.12
NO BID

$1517.52
NO BID

$10,987.44
NO BID



VERNON TOWNSHIP

Bode, William A. & Brenda L. 65-0-052687 Lot & Bldg $6298.02
NO BID
Fox, James E. & Doris P. & James E Jr.  65-0-052995 Lot & Bldg $1779.14

SOLD: Martha Feltenberger $1779.14

Hadden, John Delaney & Ada M. 65-0-052102 Lot, Bldg & Trailer $1512.47
SOLD: Kenneth Chambers $7000.00

Wonderling, Jerry & Jennifer 65-0-052625 Trailer Lot 1 $507.24
NO BID
Hannold, Gabriel J. & Amanda J. 65-0-052931 Lot $475.85
NO BID
Manuel, Kelli & Kent, Jeremi 65-0-051188 Trailer Lot 24 $2527.49
NO BID
North, Donald E. & Elizabeth L. 65-0-052808 Lot & Bldg $5060.18
NO BID
Rice, Amanda 65-0-102578 Trailer Lot 5 $545.68
NO BID
Schultz, J. Edward 65-0-050894 Lot 102 $287.06
NO BID
Vorous, Jeremy J. 65-0-052712 Lot & Bldg $3606.35
NO BID
Wonderling, Jerry 65-0-052643 Trailer Lot 17 $1080.76
NO BID

WAYNE TOWNSHIP

Fields, Gregory & Patricia 66-0-053775 % Acre $308.60
NO BID

WOODCOCK TOWNSHIP

Bartlett, Cory Thomas 67-0-055208 Trailer Lot 29 $2901.72
NO BID
Otwell, Aimee 67-0-057369 Trailer Lot 6 $956.74

NO BID



Pipper, Robert

Hopkins, Karen S.

67-0-102712

WOODCOCK BORO

68-0-055482

Trailer Lot 426

10 Acres & Bldg

$549.49
NO BID

$8548.40
NO BID



